

Exhibit 1

Greenwald Davidson Radbil PLLC - Client Summary

Date Start: 1/1/2019 | Date End: 2/21/2020 | Clients: Shoemaker, Archie | Projects: Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.
| Users: All | Account Managers: All

Date	Project	Description	Rate/ Unit Price	Labor Time/ Quantity	Billable Time/ Cost Price	Bill Amt/ Sell Price
Shoemaker, Archie						
James Davidson						
03/15/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review client documents and initial phone consultation with client.	450.00 hr	1.20	1.20	540.00
03/20/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare fee agreement and SOCR.	450.00 hr	0.30	0.30	135.00
03/25/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Exchange of correspondence with M. Lein re fee agreement and review notes from call with client.	450.00 hr	0.30	0.30	135.00
03/26/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Begin researching and drafting class action complaint.	450.00 hr	1.90	1.90	855.00
03/27/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue researching and drafting class action complaint.	450.00 hr	0.80	0.80	360.00
03/28/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and incorporate M. Lein's edits to complaint and exchange of correspondence with M. Lein re same.	450.00 hr	0.30	0.30	135.00
04/10/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Strategy with litigation team.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
04/11/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to client with draft of complaint.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
04/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with M. Lein and client re draft complaint.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
04/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise draft class action complaint and prepare exhibits.	450.00 hr	0.90	0.90	405.00
04/22/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Fee for service of complaint.	49.00 ea	1.00	49.00	49.00
04/22/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	File fee for complaint.	400.00 ea	1.00	400.00	400.00
04/22/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare new party case information sheet and prepare correspondence to clerk re same.	450.00 hr	0.20	0.20	90.00

Date	Attorney	Description	Rate	Hours	Amount	Other	Total
04/22/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review initial standing orders and and case management documents (.2); exchange of correspondence with process server re service (.1).	450.00	0.30	0.30		135.00
04/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Obtain summons from Pacer.	0.20	1.00	0.20		0.20
04/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with process server and prepare correspondence re service of process.	450.00	0.30	0.30		135.00
04/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to client with copy of filed complaint.	450.00	0.10	0.10		45.00
04/29/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Exchange of correspondence with process server and attention to return of service.	450.00	0.20	0.20		90.00
05/07/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Huff v. TeleCheck Servs., Inc., Article III standing for statutory claims, including under the FDCPA, and discussion with MG re same, and review Eastern District of Pennsylvania opinion in Pozzuolo v. Portfolio Recovery Associates, LLC discussing Article III standing in context of FDCPA.	450.00	0.50	0.50		225.00
05/15/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with MG re next steps.	450.00	0.10	0.10		45.00
05/16/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Defendant's notice of appearance.	450.00	0.10	0.10		45.00
05/17/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Defendant's answer and affirmative defenses.	450.00	0.20	0.20		90.00
05/21/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re moving Rule 16 conference.	450.00	0.10	0.10		45.00
05/21/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with Magistrate Judge Crocker's chambers re changing date of Rule 16 scheduling conference and prepare correspondence to M. Lein re same, then prepare correspondence to defense counsel with additional dates for Rule 16 conference.	450.00	0.40	0.40		180.00
05/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with court clerk re moving rule 16 conference and review email from defense counsel re same.	450.00	0.20	0.20		90.00
05/29/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re Rule 26 conference.	450.00	0.10	0.10		45.00
06/04/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review initial order and prepare rule 26 report, and send to M. Lein.	450.00	1.00	1.00		450.00

Date	Attorneys	Description	Rate	Hours	Amount	Total
06/05/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel with draft rule 26 report.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
06/05/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Revise draft Rule 26 report per defense counsel's comments and exchange of correspondence with defense counsel re same.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
06/06/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re revised Rule 26 report.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
06/06/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re Rule 26 report.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
06/18/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Begin drafting first set of written discovery to defendant.	450.00	1.40	1.40	630.00
06/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Revise first set of discovery to Defendant per JJ comments.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
06/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Initial review of Defendant's summary judgment motion and related documents and begin research for brief in opposition.	450.00	2.70	2.70	1,215.00
06/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with JJ re summary judgment brief.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
06/20/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue research regarding opposition to motion for summary judgment.	450.00	0.40	0.40	180.00
06/20/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Rule 16 conference and then brief phone call with defense counsel (.3); phone call with M. Lein re case strategy on MSJ (.3).	450.00	0.60	0.60	270.00
06/25/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review standing order re ESI (.1); attention to preliminary pretrial order (.2); prepare correspondence to defense counsel re stay of summary judgment to conduct discovery (.1).	450.00	0.40	0.40	180.00
06/25/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re discovery and staying motion for summary judgment.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
06/26/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with M. Lein re case status.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
06/27/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue drafting first set of interrogatories, requests for production and requests for admissions and review and revise (.6); conduct research regarding meaning of "principal purpose" in FDCPA (1.6).	450.00	2.20	2.20	990.00
07/01/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re discovery, summary judgment.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00

07/01/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Draft correspondence to defense counsel setting forth settlement framework and review and revise per JJ comments.	450.00 hr	0.70	0.70	315.00
07/02/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review defendant's letter to court withdrawing summary judgment motion.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
07/12/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review correspondence to bankruptcy court re stay of district court case.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
07/15/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review opinion in Smith v. BNY Mellon re FDCPA claim over foreclosures of security interest.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
07/18/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Exchange of correspondence with defense counsel re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
07/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review email from bankruptcy trustee and phone call with M. Lein re same.	450.00 hr	0.20	0.20	90.00
07/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with litigation team re case status, discovery.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
07/25/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review correspondence from defense counsel and defendant's response to plaintiff's requests for admissions.	450.00 hr	0.20	0.20	90.00
07/29/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Defendant's responses to Plaintiff's first set of discovery and production of documents (.7); prepare correspondence to defense counsel re discovery issues (.1).	450.00 hr	0.80	0.80	360.00
07/29/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Exchange of correspondence with defense counsel re class size.	450.00 hr	0.20	0.20	90.00
08/02/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re class size.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/07/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to settlement admin. re admin. estimate.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/07/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/07/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review estimate from settlement administrator and prepare correspondence to defense counsel.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/08/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Conduct research regarding whether entity engaging in judicial foreclosure constitutes a debt collector under the FDCPA and prepare for phone call with defense counsel.	450.00 hr	1.10	1.10	495.00
08/08/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.30	0.30	135.00

08/08/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.20	0.20	90.00
08/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/22/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Exchange of correspondence with defense counsel re call to discuss settlement.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/23/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.30	0.30	135.00
08/23/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Conversation with MG re settlement negotiations.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/26/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with M. Lein re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.60	0.60	270.00
08/28/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to client re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
09/03/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with M. Lein re settlement proposal (.1); phone call with client re same (.1).	450.00 hr	0.20	0.20	90.00
09/03/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review notes in advance of settlement call with defense counsel.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
09/03/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re settlement.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
09/05/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Begin drafting class action settlement agreement, and preliminary and final approval order, and class notice (4.5); prepare notice of settlement (.2); exchange of correspondence with defense counsel re same (.1); phone call with settlement administrator re notice costs	450.00 hr	4.80	4.80	2,160.00
09/06/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Strategy with MG re settlement structure.	450.00 hr	0.20	0.20	90.00
09/06/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue drafting settlement agreement and exhibits,.	450.00 hr	0.90	0.90	405.00
09/06/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Research and draft motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and JLD declaration in support.	450.00 hr	2.10	2.10	945.00
09/09/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Finalize notice of settlement (.1); incorporate MG edits to settlement agreement and exhibits (.4); prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same (.1).	450.00 hr	0.60	0.60	270.00

Date	Attorney	Description	Rate	Hours	Amount	Total
09/12/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue researching and drafting motion for preliminary approval.	450.00	0.90	0.90	405.00
09/26/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re settlement documents.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
10/02/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re settlement agreement.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
10/03/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel and prepare correspondence to M. Lein re final version of settlement agreement.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
10/03/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue researching and drafting motion for preliminary approval.	450.00	0.50	0.50	225.00
10/04/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review email from defense counsel re revised class definition, review settlement documents, and prepare correspondence to litigation team re same.	450.00	0.50	0.50	225.00
10/07/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re revised class definition (.1); revise settlement documents to encompass new class definition and exchange of correspondence with defense counsel and M. Lein re same (.5).	450.00	0.60	0.60	270.00
10/08/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re settlement agreement.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
10/09/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Finalize preliminary approval motion and related exhibits.	450.00	1.30	1.30	585.00
10/10/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare revised preliminary approval declaration per clerk's request.	450.00	0.30	0.30	135.00
11/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Defendant's correspondence with CAFA notices.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
12/31/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re preliminary approval status.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/02/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review notice of CAFA compliance.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/06/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review order granting preliminary approval of settlement (.1); prepare revisions to class notices per court order (.5); prepare correspondence to defense counsel re class list (.1); prepare correspondence to settlement administrator re notice (.1).	450.00	0.80	0.80	360.00
01/08/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Attention to compiling names and addresses of class members from raw data provided by defense counsel.	450.00	2.80	2.80	1,260.00

Date	Attorney	Description	Rate	Hours	Amount	Total
01/08/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re class list (.1); prepare correspondence to defense counsel re class list deadline (.1).	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
01/08/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with litigation team re case status.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/09/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue compiling class list name from pleadings into excel spreadsheet for class administrator (2.7); prepare correspondence to settlement administrator re same (.1).	450.00	2.80	2.80	1,260.00
01/09/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Exchange of correspondence with defense counsel re paying for class notice.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
01/10/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re payment of notice invoice (.1); review final version of postcard notice (.1); prepare pleadings and case summary for posting on website (.5).	450.00	0.70	0.70	315.00
01/14/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re payment for class notice.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/15/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with B. Hughes re notice mailing.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/16/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Strategy with litigation team class notice payment, discussions with counsel for Defendant.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/16/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare correspondence to defense counsel re payment for class notices.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/23/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Phone call with defense counsel re payment for class notice.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/24/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review correspondence from class administrator re check for class notice.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/27/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review status report for notice mailing.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/30/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Exchange of correspondence with class member Nau.	450.00	0.20	0.20	90.00
02/05/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Begin researching and drafting motion for approval of attorney's fees and reimbursement of expenses.	450.00	1.70	1.70	765.00
02/06/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Continue researching and drafting motion for approval of attorney's fees and reimbursement of expenses.	450.00	1.20	1.20	540.00
02/11/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Prepare declaration of JD in support of motion for attorneys' fees (.6); continue researching and drafting motion for attorneys' fees (1.1).	450.00	1.70	1.70	765.00

Date	Attorney	Description	Rate	Hours	Amount	Other	Total
02/12/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with MG re fee petition.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00	
			hr				
02/17/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review all time entries for privilege and confidentiality concerns.	450.00	1.00	1.00	450.00	
			hr				
02/17/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Begin researching and drafting Plaintiff's motion for final approval of class action settlement.	450.00	1.80	1.80	810.00	
			hr				
02/19/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with litigation team re fee petition.	450.00	0.10	0.10	45.00	
			hr				
02/21/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise motion for approval of attorney's fees and expenses and JLD declaration in support, then prepare correspondence to defense counsel re same.	450.00	1.00	1.00	450.00	
			hr				
Total Labor For James Davidson				55.90	55.90	25,155.00	
Total Expense For James Davidson					449.20	449.20	
Total For James Davidson						25,604.20	

Jesse Johnson

04/10/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discuss case strategy w/ team	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
04/22/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review filing of complaint	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
04/29/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review filing of return of service	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
05/16/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review filing of NOT of appearance for T. Johnson	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
05/17/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Def's Answer and affirmative defenses	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
05/17/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review order setting pretrial conference	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
05/21/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review judicial assignment order	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
06/10/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review parties' joint 26f report	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
06/18/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise Pltff's 1st sets of written discovery.	400.00	0.90	0.90	360.00	
			hr				

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount	Other
06/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discuss lit. strategy w/ JLD re: Pltff's OPP to Def's MOT for summary judgment	400.00 hr	0.20	80.00	0.20
06/19/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Def's MOT for summary judgment and to dismiss based on standing (.3); discuss lit. strategy w/ JLD for Pltff's OPP to same (.1)	400.00 hr	0.40	160.00	0.40
06/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review entry of pretrial conference order and standing order on ESI	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
07/01/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise settlement correspondence to defense counsel.	400.00 hr	0.10	40.00	0.10
07/02/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Def's MOT to withdraw its summary judgment motion	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
07/12/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review correspondence from T. Johnson to bankruptcy trustee	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
07/17/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review settlement correspondence from T. Johnson	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
07/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion w/ lit. team re: strategy for potential resolution of case, and status of case in connection with Pltff's bankruptcy proceeding	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
07/25/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Def's responses to Pltff's requests for admission	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
09/09/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review filing of NOT of settlement	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
10/02/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion w/ lit. team re: class settlement agreement & prelim approval hearing	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
01/02/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review filing of affidavit confirming CAFA compliance	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
01/03/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review preliminary approval order.	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
01/06/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review recent 6th Circuit order in Buccholz case re: standing to bring FDCPA claims	0 hr	0.30	0.00	0
01/08/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion w/ lit. team re: prelim approval order, and issuance of class notice	0 hr	0.10	0.00	0
01/10/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise draft class postcard notice	400.00 hr	0.10	40.00	0.10

01/13/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review 3d Cir. decision in Tabb v. Ocwen reversing dismissal of several 1692e claims under least sophisticated consumer standard	0 hr	0.20	0	0.00
			Total Labor For Jesse Johnson	4.10	1.70	680.00
			Total Expense For Jesse Johnson		0.00	0.00
			Total For Jesse Johnson			680.00

Michael Greenwald

03/27/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise draft class action complaint.	450.00 hr	0.40	0.40	180.00
04/10/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Complaint strategy with JD and JJ.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00
05/15/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Conversation with JD re case strategy and next steps.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00
05/21/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review correspondence to and from defense counsel.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00
07/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with litigation team re case, discovery, settlement strategy.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00
07/24/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review correspondence from bankruptcy trustee.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00
07/29/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review Defendant's financials.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
08/23/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Settlement strategy with JD.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00
09/06/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise draft settlement agreement, short form notice, long form notice, and proposed order of preliminary approval of class action settlement.	450.00 hr	1.00	1.00	450.00
10/02/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with JD re settlement agreement and preliminary approval.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00
10/04/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise motion for preliminary approval of class action settlement and declaration of JLD in support.	450.00 hr	0.80	0.80	360.00
10/07/2019	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Attention to revised class definition; discussion with JD re same.	450.00 hr	0.10	0.10	45.00
01/06/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Read order preliminarily approving class settlement.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00

Date	Client	Description	Rate	Hours	Amount	Expenses	Total
01/08/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with litigation team re class notice and case status.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
01/16/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with litigation team re notice and administration costs, and conversations with defense counsel re same.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
02/12/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Discussion with JD re fee and expense petition.	0 hr	0.10	0	0.00	
02/17/2020	Bass & Moglowsky, S.C.	Review and revise motion for attorneys' fees and litigation expenses; review and revise JD declaration in support.	450.00 hr	0.80	0.80	360.00	
Total Labor For Michael Greenwald				4.30	3.20	1,440.00	
Total Expense For Michael Greenwald					0.00	0.00	
Total For Michael Greenwald						1,440.00	
<hr/>							
Total Labor For Shoemaker, Archie				64.30	60.80	27,275.00	
Total Expense For Shoemaker, Archie					449.20	449.20	
Total For Shoemaker, Archie						27,724.20	
<hr/>							
Grand Total Labor				64.30	60.80	27,275.00	
Grand Total Expenses					449.20	449.20	
Grand Total						27,724.20	